

**BRINNIER and LARIOS, P.C.**  
PROFESSIONAL ENGINEERS & LAND SURVEYORS  
67 MAIDEN LANE  
KINGSTON, NEW YORK 12401  
-  
TELEPHONE (845) 338-7622  
FAX (845) 338-7660

DESIGN  
REPORTS  
SUPERVISION  
CONSULTING SERVICES

SUBDIVISIONS  
TITLE SURVEYS  
TOPOGRAPHIC SURVEYS

**BID TABULATION**

**CONTRACT NO. TU-191R - SALT STORAGE BUILDING**

**TOWN OF ULSTER, ULSTER COUNTY, NEW YORK**

**2:00 PM - Monday, February 25, 2019**

**BASE BID**

<b>CONTRACTOR NAME &amp; ADDRESS</b>	<b>BASE BID #1</b>	<b>BASE BID #2</b>	<b>TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID #1+#2</b>
Hybrid Building Solutions 9780 Brauer Road Clarence Center, NY 14032	\$121,044.00	\$3,300.00	<b>\$124,344.00</b>
Legacy Building Solutions 19500 C.R. 12 South Haven, MN 55382	\$144,475.00	\$2,500.00	<b>\$146,975.00</b>
Friedlander Construction 64 N Putt Corners Rd. New Paltz, NY 12561	\$283,875.00	\$4,500.00	<b>\$288,375.00</b>
Eagle Associates of Cazenovia, LLC PO Box 322 Cazenovia, NY 13035	\$293,842.00	\$4,000.00	<b>\$297,842.00</b>
A & B Construction LTD 30810 200th St Harper, IA 52231	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**ALTERNATE BID**

<b>CONTRACTOR NAME &amp; ADDRESS</b>	<b>ALT. BID #1</b>	<b>ALT. BID #2</b>	<b>TOTAL AMOUNT ALT. #1+#2</b>
A & B Construction LTD 30810 200th St Harper, IA 52231	\$109,605.00	\$5,130.00	<b>\$114,735.00</b>
Eagle Associates of Cazenovia PO Box 322 Cazenovia, NY 13035	\$130,228.00	\$4,000.00	<b>\$134,228.00</b>
Hybrid Building Solutions 9780 Brauer Road Clarence Center, NY 14032	\$133,313.00	\$3,300.00	<b>\$136,613.00</b>
Friedlander Construction 64 N Putt Corners Rd. New Paltz, NY 12561	\$278,450.00	\$4,500.00	<b>\$282,950.00</b>
Legacy Building Solutions 19500 C.R. 12 South Haven, MN 55382	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid